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What happens at a COP doesn’t stay at a COP. It 
has ramifications at the national level and other 
areas of international cooperation. But it also con-

nects with, and partly determines, the agendas of the COPs 
to come. COP30 in 2025 will be a major landmark this de-
cade, happening in the heart of the Amazon forest, and it is 
already around the corner. 

But the Amazon, as well as the current state of global 
climate ambition, is on the brink of collapse. Political, 
economic, and financial decisions have pushed the Amazo-
nian ecosystems to their limit, driving them to be very close 
to a tipping point. Activities such as oil and gas exploration 
and extraction, extensive industrial agriculture and cattle 
raising, and mining, are forcing the displacement of Indige-
nous Peoples and Local Communities (IPs and LCs) and 
pushing the forest to its limit.

This emergency is global: without the Amazon forest, we 
cannot keep global warming under 1.5°C. If we lose the 
Amazon, we will lose the fight against climate change. 

Standing against the drivers of destruction, the Indigenous 
peoples and traditional communities who have inhabited 
the rainforest for millennia are responsible today for the 
management of the healthiest portions of the Amazon, and 
are the main leaders towards our climate stability. 

That is why their voices and knowledge are essential more 
than ever to ensure climate justice and an ambitious action 
agenda is on the table at this COP and moving forward. As 
Parties conclude the Global Stocktake process in Dubai, it is 
important to ensure that the next round of NDCs, to be pre-
sented at the COP30, in Brazil, include concrete milestones 
on land tenure for climate action, with indigenous peoples 
and local communities at the center of this process. 

With COP28 kickstarted and moving towards the intensive 
negotiations days, Avaaz offers a quick briefing to help you 
navigate what is at stake for the Amazon at this COP, and why 
avoiding its collapse is crucial for the success of the climate 
agenda.

IVÁN CASTANEIRA / AVAAZ

https://www.science.org/doi/10.1126/sciadv.aat2340
https://www.nature.com/articles/s41586-021-03629-6
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Three pillars to avoid 
the Amazon collapse 
and further climate 
breakdown

IVÁN CASTANEIRA / AVAAZ

Since the Amazon Summit, held in Belém - Brazil, this past 
August, world leaders from the region set forward some good 
intentions towards a joint position to protect and conserve 
the rainforest, and to recognize the rights of IPs and LCs, but 
they failed to agree on an ambitious agenda with concrete 
measures to achieve such goals, such as ending oil extraction 
and committing to zero deforestation in the Amazon. 

In the last months between the Amazon Summit and COP28, 
the region has experienced alarming emergencies, ranging 
from severe droughts and fires from Brazil to Bolivia, 
sparked by a dangerous combination of deforestation, cli-
mate change effects, and the El Niño climate pattern. Be-
sides being a climate emergency, the Amazon collapse 
is a human rights emergency: entire communities have been 
left without clean water, they lost their crops, and become 
isolated by the dry rivers once used in their commutes. 

Now, at COP28, the Amazon, along with Indigenous leader-
ship, must be at the center of the discussions. Concrete re-
sults must emerge from this conference, demonstrating the 
commitment of global leaders to save the Amazon from the 
tipping point and ensuring the rights of the people living in 
the forest. The focus should be on protecting and conserving 
Amazonian ecosystems, respecting the human rights of IPs 
and LCs, and prioritizing an urgent shift towards equitable 
and inclusive sustainable development.

Avaaz outlines three key pillars that delegates should be con-
sidering in their negotiations, and the media should be on the 
lookout for. These pillars are critical to achieving conserva-
tion and sustainable development in the Amazon, protecting 
the crucial role it plays in regulating weather patterns in the 
region and climate around the world. Conversely, this sets the 
foundation that could benefit other crucial carbon sinks 
around the world, precisely those made of primary forests.

https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/amazon-rainforest-nations-gather-forge-shared-policy-brazil-2023-08-08/
https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/amazon-rainforest-nations-gather-forge-shared-policy-brazil-2023-08-08/
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/10/17/climate/amazon-rainforest-drought-climate-change.html
https://news.yahoo.com/bolivian-amazon-wildfires-scorch-forests-051523723.html
https://news.mongabay.com/2023/10/amazon-drought-cuts-river-traffic-leaves-communities-without-water-and-supplies/
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Pillar 1: Averting the tipping point through 
a moratorium on extractive activities 
and through protection measures

In 2019 scientists Thomas E. Lovejoy and Carlos Nobre 
warned of the existence of a tipping point and that the Ama-
zon was perilously close to reaching it. They established that 
the tipping point in the Amazon might occur once deforesta-
tion and degradation combined cross a 20-25% threshold. 
Their research refers to the eastern, southern, and central 
Amazon. 

At that time, they warned that deforestation was at 17% across 
the entire Amazon basin and approaching 20% in the Brazil-
ian Amazon. Some scientists affirm that deforestation and 
degradation have now reached 26% across the entire region.

While there has been some recent progress in policies to 
protect the Amazon- such as President Lula's commitment 
to halt deforestation in the Amazon by 2030, and evidence 
of a 59% decline in deforestation in Brazil between January 
and September 2023 compared to the same period 2022- ur-
gent and drastic measures are imperative to halt deforesta-
tion and restore critical areas. This is especially true consid-

ering escalating deforestation in neighboring countries like 
Peru and Bolivia.

However, recent developments by the Brazilian government 
signal a worrisome lack of appetite for phasing out fossil fu-
els: the country is set to join the OPEC+, and a recent study 
points out that if the government moves forward with its 
plan to drill oil in the Equatorial Margin, the greenhouse gas 
emissions from new fossil fuels would cancel out the gains 
made by reducing deforestation in the Amazon.

To ensure sustainable development in the region, protec-
tions for Amazonian ecosystems should be aligned with halt-
ing their increasing degradation by extractive and extensive 
industrial activities. Undesignated lands are especially vul-
nerable to land grabs and unsustainable or illegal activities, 
as well as privatization. In line with what has been proposed 
for the protection of the Amazon and averting its tipping 
point, Avaaz highlights the importance of COP28 meetings in 
delivering a moratorium on extractive activities (public and 
private) in the Amazon, including on Amazonian undesig-
nated lands, and for a formal commitment to protect these 
lands and its peoples. 
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https://www.science.org/doi/10.1126/sciadv.aat2340
https://www.science.org/doi/10.1126/sciadv.aba2949
https://www.science.org/doi/10.1126/sciadv.aba2949
https://www.science.org/doi/10.1126/sciadv.aba2949
https://amazonia80x2025.earth/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/diagramacion-ingles.pdf
https://www.gov.br/planalto/es/ultimas-noticias/el-presidente-lula-refuerza-su-compromiso-con-la-deforestacion-cero-y-pide-accion-a-los-paises-desarrollados-en-forum-sobre-energia-y-clima
https://eleconomista.com.ar/internacional/cae-deforestacion-amazonia-n67072
https://infoamazonia.org/wp-content/uploads/2023/03/DEFORESTACION-AMAZONIA-2025_21032023.pdf
https://es.mongabay.com/2023/05/bolivia-perdida-de-bosques-y-glaciares/
https://apublica.org/2023/12/cop28-aumento-da-producao-de-petroleo-no-brasil-pode-anular-ganhos-com-desmatamento-zero/
https://apublica.org/2023/12/cop28-aumento-da-producao-de-petroleo-no-brasil-pode-anular-ganhos-com-desmatamento-zero/
https://www.gov.br/mre/en/contact-us/press-area/press-releases/the-amazon-summit-2013-iv-meeting-of-presidents-of-the-state-parties-to-the-amazon-cooperation-treaty-2013-presidential-declaration
https://www.gov.br/mre/en/contact-us/press-area/press-releases/the-amazon-summit-2013-iv-meeting-of-presidents-of-the-state-parties-to-the-amazon-cooperation-treaty-2013-presidential-declaration
https://amazonia80x2025.earth/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/diagramacion-ingles.pdf
https://www.nature.com/articles/s41586-021-03629-6
https://www.theguardian.com/environment/2022/sep/05/large-parts-of-amazon-may-never-recover-major-study-says
https://amazonia80x2025.earth/wp-content/uploads/2022/09/diagramacion-ingles.pdf
https://imazon.org.br/imprensa/amazonia-perdeu-quase-3-mil-campos-de-futebol-por-dia-de-floresta-em-2022-maior-desmatamento-em-15-anos/
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Pillar 2: Enabling Indigenous 
leadership for climate action 

Nearly 45% of the intact forests in the Amazon are in Indige-
nous territories, an area larger than France, Great Britain, 
Germany, Italy, Norway, and Spain combined. Indigenous 
territories, including those not formally recognized, physi-
cally occupy 237 million hectares in the Amazon basin. 

There is abundant proof that the livelihoods of the Indige-
nous, and the practices that they developed through their 
cultures and management of the land, have led their territo-
ries to be the most effective at keeping the Amazon con-
served. Such conservation practices have an outsize contri-
bution to tackling climate change, halting biodiversity loss, 
and promoting sustainable development. 

Yet, a historically racist and discriminatory approach that 
has persisted to this day has led governments to long ignore 
Indigenous Peoples' knowledge, a perception that continues 
to overshadow their excellent track record in territorial 
management. In particular, cases of successful governance 
models within Indigenous communities, achieved without 
external funding, show their capacity to find balance be-
tween economic sustainability, environmental respect, and 
social development. 

To truly acknowledge and empower Indigenous leadership, 
governments must commit to protecting the human rights of 
Indigenous Peoples, fostering respect for the territories 
they've inhabited for centuries. Avaaz emphasizes the ur-
gent need for the full recognition of Indigenous lands 
and territories, ensuring legal security for Indigenous 
Peoples' land rights. Putting a stop to degrading activities 
on undesignated lands, coupled with official recognition, 
will bolster global efforts to limit temperature rise.

Additionally, IPs and LCs manage significant carbon stores 
yet often face exclusion from climate finance initiatives. Gov-
ernments, philanthropies, private entities, and financial 
partners must pledge support for Indigenous Peoples' initia-
tives and their active participation in carbon markets, 
aligned with human rights principles.

When the rights of Indigenous peoples are protected, their 
culture thrives and nature thrives. It is crucial to disseminate 
their successful stories beyond regional borders. 

IVÁN CASTANEIRA / AVAAZ

http://www.fao.org/americas/publicaciones-audio-video/forest-gov-by-indigenous/en/
http://www.fao.org/americas/publicaciones-audio-video/forest-gov-by-indigenous/en/
https://news.mongabay.com/2023/05/more-evidence-backs-indigenous-territories-as-best-safeguard-against-amazon-deforestation/
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Pillar 3: Financing should target 
the drivers of deforestation

For decades, financing the protection of the Amazon basin, 
and especially tropical forests, has been an issue of contro-
versy on which politicians still cannot agree on where this 
financing should come from, how it should be spent on, and 
how these two elements contribute to meeting the objective 
of preserving the region, for the good of humanity.

The initiatives of both governments and private actors, for 
example, REDD+, carbon markets, or reforestation focus 
their goals on paying for the result obtained, but the inter-
mediate costs are usually very high and unethical, disre-
specting the rights of Indigenous Peoples and Local Commu-
nities, such as their right to Free, Prior and Informed 
Consultation on processes.

One example is the model recently promoted by President 
Lula in Brazil focuses on rewarding countries for the “eco-
system services” that tropical forests provide, for example 
by not being cut down. While it sounds like a good idea to be 
rewarded for standing forests, several scientific groups have 
warned that this “avoided deforestation” model exaggerates 
the expected rates of future deforestation when comparing 
scenarios on how a forest would evolve if there were no poli-

cies in place to avoid deforestation. The risk is that the funds 
are simply taken as a rent, and that in the meantime, the 
country begins to dismantle its environmental regulation, as 
happened with the Bolsonaro government.

What other options do we have? The drivers of deforestation 
are multiple but they are all rooted in issues of poverty and 
development, in issues pertaining to land rights, in how cer-
tain economic sectors operate nationally (agriculture, tim-
ber), and how these sectors are connected to and influenced 
by international trade. On all of these issues, governments 
can act through regulations and economic incentives. 

Instead of overfocusing on the “result”, we need to urgently 
act on these drivers, and to develop a stronger international 
cooperation so that the international financing to stop defor-
estation is geared towards supporting sustainable develop-
ment strategies that would benefit both local populations 
and the international community. 

In this sense, it is essential to recognize that Indigenous Peo-
ples and Local Communities have been the first to demon-
strate how tropical forests can be conserved, and therefore 
it is crucial to respect their rights and recognize how their 
knowledge contributes to regulating the planet's climate.

IVÁN CASTANEIRA / AVAAZ

https://www.ifri.org/en/publications/etudes-de-lifri/geopolitics-worlds-forests-strategies-tackling-deforestation
https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/land-use-biodiversity/brazil-propose-mega-fund-conserve-forests-cop28-climate-summit-2023-11-23/
https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/land-use-biodiversity/brazil-propose-mega-fund-conserve-forests-cop28-climate-summit-2023-11-23/
https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/land-use-biodiversity/brazil-propose-mega-fund-conserve-forests-cop28-climate-summit-2023-11-23/
https://www.tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.1080/10549810902794485
https://www.tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.1080/10549810902794485
https://www.iddri.org/en/publications-and-events/issue-brief/international-biodiversity-finance-reframing-payments-ecosystem
https://www.iddri.org/en/publications-and-events/issue-brief/international-biodiversity-finance-reframing-payments-ecosystem
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Avaaz – meaning “voice” in several European, Middle East-
ern and Asian languages— launched in 2007 with a simple 
democratic mission: organize citizens of all nations to close 
the gap between the world we have and the world most peo-
ple everywhere want. Currently, Avaaz has a membership of 
almost 70 million people from all countries and territories. 

Avaaz empowers millions of people from all walks of life to 
take action on pressing global, regional and national issues, 
from corruption and poverty to conflict and the environ-
ment. Our model of internet organising allows thousands of 
individual efforts, however small, to be rapidly combined 
into a collective force. 

For more information and tips in real time on COP28, join 
Avaaz’s WhatsApp channel to receive updates from our ex-
perts: https://bit.ly/AvaazUpdatesCOP28.

You can check our policy paper for COP28 here: https://
avaaz.org/AvoidAmazonCollapseCOP28

For more information and interviews: media@avaaz.org  

Luciana Weyne: +1 (571) 621-2896, luciana@avaaz.org

About Avaaz

https://bit.ly/AvaazUpdatesCOP28
https://bit.ly/AvaazUpdatesCOP28
https://avaaz.org/AvoidAmazonCollapseCOP28
https://avaaz.org/AvoidAmazonCollapseCOP28
mailto:media@avaaz.org
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